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A N N U A L  R E P O R T  2 0 00    

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES

(a) Statement of compliance

These accounts have been prepared in

accordance with all applicable Statements of

S t a n d a r d  A c c o u nt i n g  P ra c t i c e  a n d

Interpretations issued by the Hong Kong

Society of Accountants, accounting principles

generally accepted in Hong Kong and the

requirements of the Hong Kong Companies

Ordinance. A summary of the significant

accounting policies adopted by the group is

set out below.

(b) Basis of preparation of the accounts

(i) Going concern basis

For the year ended 31st December,

2000, the group incurred a loss of

$1,152.8 million (1999: $1,213.1 million)

and also had net current liabilities of

$1,811.6 mil lion (1999: net current

asse ts  o f  $421.2  m i l l i on ) .  Th e

shareholders’ funds reduced from

$3,298.9 million as at 31st December,

1999 to $2,094.9 million as at 31st

December, 2000.

1.

(a)

(b)

(i)

1,152,800,000

1,213,100,000

1,811,600,000

421,200,000

3,298,900,000

2,094,900,000
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(b) Basis of  preparat ion of  the accounts

(continued)

(i) Going concern basis (continued)

On 1st December, 2000, the company

requested its bankers for an informal

standstill arrangement on the payment

of all Hong Kong bank loan principal

and interest totalling approximately

$1.9 billion, pending the approval by

the group’s bankers of a formal debt

restructuring plan. The company has

also requested a similar standsti l l

arrangement with the holders of the

floating rate notes (“the FRNs”) with

outstanding balance of US$37 million

issued by Hong Kong Construction

(Capital )  L imited, a wholly-owned

subsidiary of the company. The FRNs

were due for  repayment on 11th

December, 2000. In accordance with

the terms of the issue of the FRNs

and the bank facility agreements, the

group was in default of the notes and

all its bank borrowings.

1.

(b)

(i)

1,900,000,000

Hong

Kong Construction (Capital)

Ltd

37,000,000
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(b) Basis of  preparat ion of  the accounts

(continued)

(i) Going concern basis (continued)

In January 2001, the company entered

into a Facility Agreement and Security

Sharing Agreement with banks (“the

Secured Banks”) having security over

the receivables of  certain of  the

company’s construction projects under

which the Secured Banks have agreed

to make further  advances to the

company to enable it  to pay the

subcontractors of its ongoing projects.

The Secured Banks were provided with

a  baske t  o f  addi t iona l  secu r i t y

comprising properties, shares and a

debenture incorporating fixed and

floating charges over the assets and

under t ak ing of the  company. In

accordance with a “Buyout, Repayment

and Release Deed” dated 4th May,

2001 entered into with the Secured

Banks, the company successful ly

negotiated the release of security over

projects’  receivables and thereby

making available for the use of the

g r o u p  f u t u r e  p r o c e e d s  f r o m

construction projects.

1.

(b)

(i)
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(b) Basis of  preparat ion of  the accounts

(continued)

(i) Going concern basis (continued)

Furthermore, Yangpu Power (Hainan) Co
Ltd, a 40% associate of the group has
agreed with a th ird party for  the
disposal of the Yangpu power plant for
a consideration of $1,000 mil l ion.
Deposits totalling approximately $555
million have been received subsequent
to  the  year  end  sub jec t  to  t he
complet ion of  a formal sale and
purchase agreement. The directors are
confident that the sale of the power
plant will be completed resulting in
substantial  external funding to the
group.

The directors are currently in active
negotiations with the group’s bankers
to formalise the standstill arrangement,
to restructure the repayment of the
group’s indebtedness and to agree a
plan to gradually dispose of certain of
its property interests. The directors
believe that the ongoing support from
its bankers will be forthcoming and the
disposal of the Yangpu power plant will
be finalised and the balance of the
proceeds received in full. The directors
are confident that the funds generated
from the disposal of Yangpu power
plant together with the other measures
t o  b e  t a k e n  u n d e r  t h e  d e b t
restructuring plan will enable the group
to continue in operational existence in
the foreseeable future.

1.

(b)

(i)

40%

1,000,000,000

555,000,000
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(b) Basis of  preparat ion of  the accounts

(continued)

(i) Going concern basis (continued)

Accordingly, the directors are satisfied

that it is appropriate to prepare the

accounts on a going concern basis,

notwithstanding the group’s financial

position as at 31st December, 2000.

Should the group be unable to continue

in business  as  a going concern ,

adjustments would have to be made

to restate the values of assets to their

recoverable amounts, to provide for any

further liabilities which might arise and

to reclassify non-current assets and

l i abi l i t ies as  current assets  and

liabilities, respectively. The effect of

these adjustments have not been

reflected in the accounts.

(ii) The measurement basis used in the

preparation of the accounts is historical

cost modified by the revaluation of

investment properties, and the marking

to market of certain investments in

secu r i t ies  as  exp la ined  in  t he

accounting policies set out below.

1.

(b)

(i)

(ii)
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(c) Basis of consolidation

(i) The consolidated accounts include the

accounts of the company and all its

subsidiaries made up to 31st December

each year. The results of subsidiaries

acquired or disposed of during the year

are included in the consolidated profit

and loss account from or to the date

of their acquisition or d isposal, as

appropriate. All material intercompany

t r ansac t ions  and  ba lanc es  a re

eliminated on consolidation.

(ii) Goodwill arising on the acquisition of

subsidiaries, being the excess of the

cost of investments in these companies

over the fair value of the group’s share

of the separable net assets acquired,

is charged to retained profits in the year

in which it arises. The excess of the

group’s share of the fair value of the

separable net assets of subsidiaries

acquired over the cost is credited to

capital reserve.

On disposal of a subsidiary during the

year, any att r ibu table amount of

purchased goodwill or capital reserve

which has previously been dealt with

as a movement on group reserves is

included in the calculation of the profit

or loss on disposal.

1.

(c)

(i)

(ii)
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(d) Investments in subsidiaries

A subsidiary is a company in which the group,

directly or indirectly, holds more than half of

the issued capital, or controls more than half

o f  the  vo t ing power,  or  con t ro ls  the

composition of the board of directors.

Investments in subsidiaries in the company’s

balance sheet are stated at cost less any

provisions for diminution in value which is

other than temporary as determined by the

directors for each subsidiary individually. Any

such provisions are recognised as an expense

in the profit and loss account of the company.

(e) Associates and jointly controlled entities

An associate is an entity in which the group

or company has significant influence, but not

control or joint control, over its management,

including participation in the financial and

operating policy decisions.

A jointly controlled entity is an entity which

operates under a contractual arrangement

between the group or company and other

parties, where the contractual arrangement

establishes that the group or company and

one or more of the other parties share joint

control over the economic activity of the entity.

1.

(d)

(e)
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(e) Associates and jointly controlled entities

(continued)

Unless the interest in the associate or the

jointly controlled entity is acquired and held

exclusively with a view to subsequent disposal

in the near future,  an investment in an

associate or a joint ly control led entity is

accounted for in the consolidated accounts

under the equity method and is in itia l ly

recorded at cost and adjusted thereafter for

the post acquisition change in the group’s

share of the associate’s or the jointly controlled

entity’s net assets. The consolidated profit and

loss account reflects the group’s share of the

post-acquisition results of the associates and

jointly controlled entities for the year. Goodwill

arising on the acquisition of an associate or a

jointly controlled entity, being the excess of

the cost over the fair value of the group’s share

of the separable net assets acquired, is

charged to retained profits in the year in which

it arises. The excess of the group’s share of

the fair value of the separable net assets

acquired over the cost of investment is

credited directly to capital reserves.

Unrealised profits and losses resulting from

transactions between the group and its

associates and jointly controlled entities are

eliminated to the extent of the group’s interest

in the associate or jointly controlled entity,

except where unreal ised losses provide

evidence of an impairment of the asset

transferred, in which case they are recognised

immediately in the profit and loss account.

1.

(e)
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(e) Associates and jointly controlled entities

(continued)

On disposal of  an associate or a jo int ly

control led ent i t y  dur ing the  year,  any

attributable amount of purchased goodwill or

capital reserve which has previously been dealt

with as a movement on group reserves is

included in the calculation of the profit or loss

on disposal.

The results of the associates and jointly

control led ent i t ies  are inc luded  in the

company’s profit and loss account to the extent

of dividends received and receivable, providing

the dividend is in respect of a period ending

on or before that of the company and the

company’s right to receive the dividend is

establ ished before the accounts of  the

company are approved by the directors. In the

company’s balance sheet, its investments in

associates and jointly controlled entities are

stated  at  cost  less  any provisions  for

diminut ion in value which is other than

temporary as determined by the directors for

each associate or jointly control led entity

individually. Any such provisions are recognised

as an expense in the profit and loss account

of the company.

1.

(e)
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(f) Other investments in securities

The group’s and the company’s policies for

investments  in  secu r i t ies  other  than

investments in subsidiaries, associates and

jointly controlled entities are as follows:

(i) Trading securities are stated in the

balance sheet at fair value. Changes in

fair value are recognised in the profit

and loss account as they arise.

(ii) Non-trading securities are stated in the

balance sheet at fair value. Changes in

fa i r  va lue a re recogn ised in the

investment revaluation reserve until the

security is sold, collected, or otherwise

disposed of, or until there is objective

evidence that the security is impaired,

at which time the relevant cumulative

gain or loss is transferred from the

investment revaluation reserve to the

profit and loss account.

(iii) Tr ans fe rs  f rom  the  investm ent

revaluation reserve to the profit and

loss account as a result of impairments

are reversed when the circumstances

and events that led to the impairment

cease to exist and there is persuasive

evidence that the new circumstances

and  events  w i l l  pe rs is t  fo r  the

foreseeable future.

1.

(f)

(i)

(ii)

(iii)



62

A N N U A L  R E P O R T  2 0 00    

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(f) Other investments in securities (continued)

(iv) Prof i ts o r  losses on disposa l  of

investments in securities are accounted

for in the profit and loss account as

they arise. In the case of non-trading

securities, the profit or loss includes

any amount previously held in the

investment revaluation reserve in

respect of that security.

(g) Fixed assets

(i) Fixed assets are carried in the balance

sheets on the following bases:

• investment properties with an

unexpired lease term of more

than 20 years are stated in the

balance sheet at their open

market value, which is assessed

annually by external qualified

valuers; and

• properties held for own use and

other fixed assets are stated in

the balance sheet at carrying

value or cost less aggregate

depreciation.

1.

(f)

(iv)

(g)

(i)

•

•
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(g) Fixed assets (continued)

(ii) Changes arising on the revaluation of

investment properties are generally

dealt with in investment properties

reva lua t ion  rese r ves .  The  on l y

exceptions are as follows:

• when  a  de f ic i t  a r i ses  on

revaluation, it will be charged

to the profit and loss account,

if  and to the extent that it

exceeds the amount held in the

rese rve  in  respect o f  the

p o r t fo l i o  o f  i nve s t m e n t

properties immediately prior to

the revaluation; and

• when  a  su rp lus  a r i ses  on

revaluation, it will be credited

to the profit and loss account,

if and to the extent that a deficit

on revaluation in respect of the

p o r t fo l i o  o f  i nve s t m e n t

properties had previously been

charged to the profit and loss

account.

1.

(g)

(ii)

•

•
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(g) Fixed assets (continued)

(iii) Subsequent expenditure relating to a

fixed asset that has already been

recognised is added to the carrying

amount of the asset when it is probable

that future economic benef its,  in

excess of  the orig inal ly assessed

standard of performance of the existing

asset, will flow to the enterprise. All

other subsequent expenditure is

recognised as an expense in the period

in which it is incurred.

(iv) Gains  or  losses ar ising f rom the

retirement or disposal of a fixed asset

are determined as the difference

between the estimated net disposal

proceeds and the carrying amount of

the fixed asset and are recognised in

the profit and loss account on the date

of retirement or disposal. On disposal

of an investment property, the related

por t ion o f  surpluses  or  def ic i ts

previously taken to the investment

properties revaluation reserve is also

transferred to the profit  and loss

account for the year. For all other fixed

assets, any related revaluation surplus

is transferred from the revaluation

reserve to retained profits.

1.

(g)

(iii)

(iv)
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(h) Other properties

(i) Properties held for development

Properties held for development are

stated at cost less any provisions for

diminution in value as determined by

the directors.

(ii) Properties under development

Properties under development are

stated at specifically identified cost,

including borrowing costs capitalised,

aggregate cost of  development ,

material and supplies, wages and other

direct expenses, less any provisions

considered necessary by the directors.

(iii) Properties held for sale

Properties held for sale are stated at

the lower of cost and the estimated

net real isable value. In the case of

properties developed by the group, cost

is determined by apportionment of the

total development costs for  that

deve lopm ent p ro jec t ,  inc lud ing

borrowing costs capitalised, attributable

to the unsold properties. Net realisable

value is the estimated selling price less

costs to be incurred in sel l ing the

property.

1.

(h)

(i)

(ii)

(iii)
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(h) Other properties (continued)

(iv) Land under development

All expenditure incurred during the

development period in connection with

the development of infrastructure of

certain land held by an associate is

trea ted  as  a  cos t  of  l and unde r

development.  Such costs include

construction costs, financing costs,

exchange differences on loans to

finance the development, and other

overheads.

The cost attributable to each land site

is determined by apportioning the total

estimated cost of the development

(less amounts written off related to

previous sales) based on the estimated

selling price of the relevant site to the

aggregate of the total sales price of

sites sold to date and of the estimated

total sales price of all unsold sites on

hand at the balance sheet date. When

a  sa le  i s  r ecog n is ed  the  cos t

attributable to the relevant site is

charged to the profit and loss account.

1.

(h)

(iv)
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(h) Other properties (continued)

(v) Profit  recognition on pre-sales of

properties under development

The estimated profit on pre-sales of

propert ies under development is

recogn ised  ove r  t he  course  o f

development when the outcome of the

development can be reasonably

foreseen. The profit recognised on the

pre-sold properties is determined by

the apportionment of the estimated

pro f i t  over  the  en t i re per iod o f

construction to reflect the progress of

the development and is calculated by

re fe rence to  the  p ropo r t ion  o f

development costs incurred up to the

accounting date to the estimated total

development costs to completion, but

is l imited to the amount of  sales

deposits received and due allowances

are made for contingencies.

(i) Depreciation

(i) No  deprec ia t ion i s  p rov ided on

investm ent  p rope r t ies  w i th  an

unexpired lease term of over 20 years

or on freehold land.

(ii) No  deprec ia t ion i s  p rov ided on

properties under development/held for

development.

1.

(h)

(v)

(i)

(i)

(ii)
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(i) Depreciation (continued)

(iii) Depreciation is calculated to write off

the cost of other fixed assets over their

estimated useful lives as follows:

• leasehold land is depreciated on

a straight-line basis over the

remaining term of the lease;

• buildings are depreciated on a

straight - l ine basis over the

shorter of their estimated useful

lives, being 50 years from the

date of completion, and the

unexpired terms of the leases;

and

• other fixed assets, comprising

machiner y and equipment,

vehicles, vessels, and fixtures

and fittings are depreciated on

a straight-line basis over their

anticipated useful lives of 4 to

10 years.

1.

(i)

(iii)

•

•

•
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(j) Revenue recognition

Provided it is probable that the economic

benefits will flow to the group and the revenue

and costs, if applicable, can be measured

reliably, revenue is recognised in the profit

and loss account as follows:

(i) Sale of properties

Revenue arising from properties held

for sale is recognised upon the signing

of the sale and purchase agreements

or the issue of an occupation permit

by the relevant government authorities,

whichever is the later. Deposits and

instalments received on properties sold

prior to the date of revenue recognition

are included in the balance sheet under

“Creditors and accrued expenses”.

(ii) Contract revenue

When the outcome of a construction

contract can be estimated reliably:

• revenue from a fixed pr ice

contract is recognised using the

pe rcen tage o f  comp le t ion

method, measured by reference

to the percentage of contract

costs  incu rred  to  da te  to

estimated total contract costs

for the contract; and

1.

(j)

(i)

(ii)

•
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(j) Revenue recognition (continued)

(ii) Contract revenue (continued)

• revenue from a  cost  p lus

contr ac t  i s  recogn ised by

reference to the recoverable

costs incurred during the period

plus the fee earned, measured

by the proportion that costs

incurred to date bear to the

estimated total costs of the

contract.

When the outcome of a construction

contract cannot be estimated reliably,

revenue is recognised only to the

extent of contract costs incurred that

it is probable will be recoverable.

(iii) Rental income from operating leases

Renta l  income receivable unde r

operating leases is recognised on a

straight-line basis over the term of the

lease.

(iv) Dividends

• dividend income from unlisted

i nve s t m e n ts  o th e r  t ha n

associates and jointly controlled

entities is recognised when the

shareholder’s right to receive

payment is established.

1.

(j)

(ii)

•

(iii)

(iv)

•
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(j) Revenue recognition (continued)

(iv) Dividends (continued)

• dividend income from l isted

investments is recognised when

t h e  s h a r e  p r i c e  o f  t h e

investment goes ex-dividend.

(v) Interest income from bank deposits,

contract receivables and other loans

and advances is accrued on a time-

apportioned basis on the principal

outstanding and at the rate applicable.

(k) Construction contracts

The accounting policy for contract revenue is

set out at  note 1( j ) (i i )  above. When the

outcome of a construction contract can be

est imated re l i ably ,  contrac t  cos ts a re

recognised as expenses by reference to the

stage of completion of the contract activity at

the balance sheet date. When it is probable

that total contract costs will  exceed total

contract  revenue, the expected loss is

recognised as an expense immediately. When

the outcome of a construction contract cannot

be estimated rel iably, contract costs are

recognised as an expense in the period in

which they are incurred.

1.

(j)

(iv)

•

(v)

(k)

1(j)(ii)
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(k) Construction contracts (continued)

Construction contracts in progress at the

balance sheet date are recorded in the balance

sheet at the net amount of costs incurred plus

recognised profits less recognised losses and

progress billings, and are presented in the

balance sheet as the “Gross amount due from

customers for contract work” (as an asset) or

the “Gross amount due to customers for

contract work” (as a liability), as applicable.

Progress billings not yet paid by the customer

are included in the balance sheet under

“Debto rs , depos i ts  and prepayments”.

Amounts received before the related work is

performed are included in the balance sheet,

as a liability, as “Advances received”.

(l) Deferred taxation

Deferred taxation is provided using the liability

method in respect of the taxation effect arising

from all material timing differences between

the accounting and tax treatment of income

and expenditure, which are expected with

reasonable probabil ity to crystalise in the

foreseeable future.

Future deferred tax benefits are not recognised

unless their real isation is assured beyond

reasonable doubt.

1.

(k)

(l)
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(m) Translation of foreign currencies

Foreign currency transactions during the year
are translated into Hong Kong dollars at the
exchange rates ruling at the transaction dates.
Monetary assets and liabilities denominated
in foreign currencies are translated into Hong
Kong dollars at the exchange rates ruling at
the balance sheet date. Exchange gains and
losses are dealt with in the profit and loss
account.

The results of overseas subsidiaries are
translated into Hong Kong dol lars at the
average exchange rates for the year; balance
sheet items are retranslated at the rate of
exchange ruling at the balance sheet date. The
exchange differences are dealt with as a
movement in reserves.

(n) Operating leases

Rental payable under operating leases is
accounted for in the profit and loss account
on a straight-line basis over the periods of the
respective leases.

(o) Retirement costs

The g roup  opera tes  a  def ined  benef i t
retirement scheme and the regular cost of
providing retirement benefits is charged to the
profit and loss account over the expected
service lives of the members of the scheme
on  the  bas is  o f  leve l  pe rcentages  o f
pensionable pay. Variations from regular cost
arising from periodic actuarial valuations are
allocated to the profit and loss account over
the expected remaining service lives of the
members.

1.

(m)

(n)

(o)
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(o) Retirement costs (continued)

In addit ion,  the company  has set up a

Mandatory Provident Fund (“MPF”) Scheme

by participating in a master trust scheme

provided by an independent MPF service

provider to comply with the requirements

under the MPF Ordinance. Contributions paid

and payable by the Company to the scheme

are charged to the profit and loss account.

(p) Borrowing costs

Borrowing costs are expensed in the profit and

loss account in the period in which they are

incurred, except to the extent that they are

capitalised as being directly attributable to the

acquisition, construction or production of an

asset which necessarily takes a substantial

period of time to get ready for its intended

use or sale.

The capitalisation of borrowing costs as part

of the cost of a qualifying asset commences

when expenditures for the asset are being

incurred, borrowing costs are being incurred

and activities that are necessary to prepare

the asset for its intended use or sale are in

progress. Capitalisation of borrowing costs is

suspended or ceases when substantially all

the act ivities necessary to prepare the

qualifying asset for its intended use or sale

are interrupted or complete.

1.

(o)

(p)
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

1. SIGNIFICANT ACCOUNTING POLICIES (continued)

(q) Related parties

For the purposes of these accounts, parties

are considered to be related to the group if

the group has the ability, directly or indirectly,

to control the party or exercise significant

influence over the party in making financial

and operating decisions, or vice versa, or

where the group and the party are subject to

common control or common signif icant

influence. Related parties may be individuals

or other entities.

(r) Cash equivalents

Cash equivalents are short-term, highly liquid

investments which are readily convertible into

known amounts of cash without notice and

which were within three months of maturity

when acquired. For the purposes of the cash

flow statement, cash equivalents would also

include advances from banks repayable within

three months from the date of the advance.

2. TURNOVER

The pr inc ipa l  ac t i vi t ies  of the company  are

construc t ion and  propert y  developm ent  and

investment. The principal activities of the subsidiaries

are set out in pages 120 to 123 on the accounts.

1.

(q)

(r)

2.

120 123
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

2. TURNOVER (continued)

Turnover represents revenue from construction

contracts, rental income and proceeds from sale of

properties. The amount of each significant category

of revenue recognized in turnover during the year is

as follows:

2000 1999

$ Million $ Million

Revenue from construction contracts 1,867.4 2,961.2

Rental income 22.2 26.7

Proceeds from sale of properties 2.9 17.0

1,892.5 3,004.9

2.
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

3. SEGMENTAL INFORMATION

The analysis of the principal activities and geographical

locations of the operations of the company and its

subsidiaries during the financial year are as follows:

Contributions to

loss/(profit) from

operations

Group turnover

2000 1999 2000 1999

$ Million $ Million $ Million $ Million

Principal activities

Construction contracts 1,867.4 2,961.2 277.4 156.4

Property rental 22.2 26.7 (22.2) (26.7)

Property trading 2.9 17.0 2.0 1.2

1,892.5 3,004.9

Other group expenses net of

other income 56.5 205.1

313.7 336.0

Geographical locations

of operations

Hong Kong and others 1,722.6 2,592.4 334.7 270.4

The People’s Republic

of China 169.9 412.5 (21.0) 65.6

1,892.5 3,004.9 313.7 336.0

3.
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

4. OTHER REVENUE

2000 1999

$ Million $ Million

Dividend income from listed securities – 0.1

Dividend income from unlisted securities 0.2 0.7

Interest income 103.7 206.6

Property fee income 20.1 16.0

Other income 9.9 –

133.9 223.4

4.

5. LOSS FROM ORDINARY ACTIVITIES BEFORE

TAXATION

Loss from ordinary activities before taxation is arrived

at after charging/(crediting):

2000 1999

$ Million $ Million

(a) Other net (income)/loss (a)

Net profit on sale of fixed assets (3.7) (4.3)

Net realised and unrealised losses

on trading securities carried at

fair value 0.4 22.2

Loss on disposal of non-trading securities 5.5 –

Exchange (gain)/loss (14.0) 71.3

Net loss on supply of building materials 0.8 4.2

Others (1.4) –

(12.4) 93.4

5.

)
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

5. LOSS FROM ORDINARY ACTIVITIES BEFORE

TAXATION (continued)

Loss on disposal of non-trading securities included a

deficit of $5.4 million (1999: $Nil) transferred from

non-trading securities revaluation reserve. Net profit

on sale of fixed assets included a surplus of $3.1

million (1999: $6.8 million) transferred from investment

properties revaluation reserve.

5.

5,400,000

3,100,000 6,800,000

2000 1999

$ Million $ Million

(b) Other operating expenses (b)

Provision against proceeds receivable

in respect of disposal of interest

in an associate – 75.0

Provision for bad and doubtful debts 31.8 101.3

Provision for diminution in value

of properties 50.0 45.5

Write off of tendering and other costs – 12.7

Others 6.9 16.0

88.7 250.5

(c) Finance cost (c)

Interest on bank advance and other

borrowings repayable within five years

292.5 279.3

Amortisation of floating rate notes

issue expenses 1.3 1.3

293.8 280.6
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

5. LOSS FROM ORDINARY ACTIVITIES BEFORE

TAXATION (continued)

(d) Provision for interest in associates

This represents provision against interest in

associates. The amount in 1999 includes an

amount of $346.5 million in respect of the

diminution in value of the group’s 40% interest

in Yangpu Power (HK) Co. Limited.

2000 1999

$ Million $ Million

(e) Other items (e)

Cost of properties sold 4.9 18.1

Staff costs (including retirement costs

of $11.1 million (1999: $7.8 million)) * 11,100,000 1999

7,800,000 * 47.3 49.7

Auditors’ remuneration 7.2 4.9

Depreciation * * 3.0 3.7

Operating lease charges in respect

of property 5.0 5.1

Rentals receivable from investment

properties less direct outgoings 2,200,000

of $2.2 million (1999: $0.4 million) 1999 400,000 (18.6) (17.8)

5.

(d)

 

40%

346,500,000

* Staff costs and depreciation of $70.1 million
(1999: $51.6 million) and $1.0 million (1999:
$0.5 million) respectively were charged to
cost of construction contracts.

* 70,100,000
51 , 600 , 000

1,000,000 500,000
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

6. DIRECTORS’ REMUNERATION

Directors’ remuneration disclosed pursuant to section

161 of the Hong Kong Companies Ordinance is as

follows:

2000 1999

$ Million $ Million

Fees 0.2 0.3

Salaries and other emoluments 21.5 25.8

Discretionary bonuses 0.9 0.3

Retirement scheme contributions 0.1 0.3

22.7 26.7

6.

161

Included in the directors’ remuneration were fees of

$0.1 mil l ion  (1999:  $0.1 mi l l i on)  paid to the

independent non-executive directors during the year.

In addition to the above emoluments, certain directors

were granted share options under the company’s

share option scheme. The details of these benefits in

kind are disclosed under the paragraph “Directors’

and Chief Executive’s interests” in the directors’

report.

In the absence of a ready market for the options

granted on the shares of the company, the directors

are unable to arrive at an accurate assessment of the

value of the options granted to the respective

directors.

100,000 100,000
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

6. DIRECTORS’ REMUNERATION (continued)

The remuneration of the directors is within the

following bands:

2000 1999

Number of Number of

directors directors

$ Nil – 1,000,000 1,000,000 10 13

$ 1,000,001 – 1,500,000 1,000,001 1,500,000 2 1

$ 1,500,001 – 2,000,000 1,500,001 2,000,000 2 1

$ 2,500,001 – 3,000,000 2,500,001 3,000,000 1 1

$ 3,000,001 – 3,500,000 3,000,001 3,500,000 1 2

$ 3,500,001 – 4,000,000 3,500,001 4,000,000 – 1

$ 4,000,001 – 4,500,000 4,000,001 4,500,000 1 –

$ 4,500,001 – 5,000,000 4,500,001 5,000,000 – 1

$ 5,000,001 – 5,500,000 5,000,001 5,500,000 1 1

6.

7. INDIVIDUALS WITH HIGHEST EMOLUMENTS

Of the five individuals with the highest emoluments,

all (1999: all) are directors of the company, whose

emoluments are disclosed in note 6.

7.

6
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

8. TAXATION

(a) Taxation in the consolidated profit and loss

account represents:

The group

2000 1999

$ Million $ Million

PRC taxation – 4.9

(Overprovision)/underprovision of

Hong Kong profits tax in respect

of prior years (23.3) 4.0

(23.3) 8.9

Share of associates’ taxation 4.2 14.7

(19.1) 23.6

8.

(a)

No provision has been made for Hong Kong profits

tax as the company and its subsidiaries in Hong Kong

sustained losses for taxation purposes during the year.
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For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

8. TAXATION (continued)

(b) Taxat ion payable in the balance sheets

represents:

The group The company

2000 1999 2000 1999

$ Million $ Million $ Million $ Million

Hong Kong profits tax

– tax recoverable (4.8) – (4.8) –

– balance of profits tax

provision relating

to prior years – 24.8 – 24.8

PRC taxation 53.4 51.7 41.0 41.0

48.6 76.5 36.2 65.8

8.

(b)

(c) There are no significant potential deferred tax

liabilities for which provision has not been

made.

9. LOSS ATTRIBUTABLE TO SHAREHOLDERS

The loss attributable to shareholders includes a loss

of $1,605.6 million (1999: loss of $923.3 million) which

has been dealt with in the accounts of the company.

(c)

9.

1,605 ,600 ,000

923,300,000
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NOTES ON THE ACCOUNTS (continued)

For the year ended 31st December, 2000
(Expressed in Hong Kong dollars)

10. LOSS PER SHARE

(a) Basic loss per share

The calculation of basic loss per share is based

on net loss for the year attributable to ordinary

shareholders of  $1,152.8 mi l l ion (1999:

$1,213.1 million) and on 507.9 million (1999:

506.2 mil lion) ordinary shares, being the

weighted average number of ordinary shares

outstanding during the year.

(b) Diluted loss per share

There were no di lutive potential ordinary

shares in existence during the years 1999 and

2000.

10.

(a)

1,152,800,000

1,213,100,000

507 ,900 ,000

506,200,000

(b)


