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Corporate Profile
Solomon Systech (International) Limited is a leading fabless
semiconductor company specializing in the design,
development and sales of proprietary IC products that enable
sophisticated display applications such as mobile phones,
handheld devices and LCD TVs.

The Group has an experienced design team of  high caliber in
Mixed Mode High Voltage System-On-Chip (HV-SoC) and Very
Large Scale Integration (VLSI) design, and produces highly
integrated IC products for all current mainstream display
technologies. Such IC products include STN/CSTN/TFT LCD
driver controllers, OLED driver controllers, graphics
controllers and image processors for mobile displays, TFT
drivers and timing controllers for large displays.

Currently being a global market leader in mobile phone display
ICs, the Group is developing ICs in new display areas for
high-tech consumer electronic products such as microdisplay
for mobile video applications and bistable display for electronic
paper applications.  Thanks to its ability to quickly and
successfully commercialize new product ideas, the Group has a
competitive edge over its rivals in the fast-moving flat panel
display area.

The Group serves many blue-chip clients and has received
numerous awards from its customers, suppliers, industrial
organizations as well as the investment community. In April
2004, the Company was listed on the Main Board of The Stock
Exchange of Hong Kong Limited (HKSE: 2878).  As of end of
2005, it had a workforce of approximately 320 employees.


