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ANNOUNCEMENT ON THE RESOLUTIONS OF THE FOURTEENTH
MEETING OF THE FIFTH SESSION OF THE BOARD OF DIRECTORS

China Petroleum & Chemical Corporation and the directors of the Board of
Directors of China Petroleum & Chemical Corporation warrant that there are no
material omissions, misrepresentations or misleading statements contained in this
announcement and severally and jointly accept full responsibility for the
authenticity, accuracy and completeness of the information contained in this
announcement.

China Petroleum & Chemical Corporation (“Sinopec” or the “Company”) served the
written notice of the fourteenth meeting (the “Meeting”) of the Company’s Fifth
Session of the Board of Directors (the “Board”) on 16 February 2014 and held the
Meeting on 19 February 2014 by way of written resolution. The Meeting was
convened and held in compliance with the provisions of applicable laws and the
Articles of Association of Sinopec.

All the directors of the Company considered and unanimously approved the Proposal
to Start the Restructuring of Sinopec’s Marketing Segment and to Introduce Social
and Private Capital to Realize Diversified Ownership of this Segment.

The Board agreed to restructure Sinopec’s oil product marketing segment based on
the results of the audits and valuation to be conducted on the current assets and
liabilities of this segment. It also agreed to diversify the ownership of this segment
by way of introducing social and private capital investment. The shareholding
percentage for social and private investors will be determined according to the
market conditions. The Board hereby authorizes the Chairman to take the following
actions under the circumstance that the shareholding percentage of social and private
investors does not exceed 30% (including but not limited to): (1) to determine the
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investors, their shareholding percentages and the terms and conditions of their

participation in the marketing segment and to organize the implementation of the

plans for such participation; (2) to sign transaction documents and other relevant

documents and to attend to the approval, registration, filing and disclosure

procedures in relation to the aforesaid matters. The Company will comply with the

approval and disclosure requirements under the laws and regulations of its place of

listing based on the progress of the project.

By order of the Board
Huang Wensheng

Secretary to the Board of Directors

19 February 2014
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